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abortion, which is negligently carried 
out. The  child is born with a genetic 
disease. The child is denied standing 
to sue in a Fvrongful life suit, and the 
parents cannot sue for wrongful 
birth.3 

compensation while the couple in 
Case 1 can, although both couples 
were (1) subjected to subprofessional 
conduct, perhaps even gross negli- 
gence, by physicians, (2) which 
caused them. (3) the expense of 3 

child with substantial impairments. So 
long as abortion is a legally obtain- 
able reproductive choice, the couple 
in Case 2 is being unfairly and arbi- 
trarily denied resource to litigation to 
compensate them for the negligent 
acts of a third party on  whose compe- 
tence they relied. This unequal treat- 
ment of parties in roughly the w m e  
position gives rise to a constitutional 
problem-denial of equal protec- 
tion-where a tort rule operates un- 
equally and unfairly. The CHA pro- 
posal, if enacted by a state, is likely to 
b e  struck down as unconstitutional.' 

The tort system has its critics; and it 
does indeed have uneven effects in a 
variety of situations, due  to lack of 
consumer information about the right 
to sue, to economics, or to other fac- 
tors. Nonetheless, there is no  justifica- 
cion for compounding the existing in- 
equalities of the system by creating 
another anomaly, in which the moral 
beliefs of a vocal minority are in- 
jected into the common law system. 

Conscientious health care profes- 
sionals have sought for years to en-  
sure the availability of safe and effec- 
tive abortions? Many experts contend 
that only by providing the best medi- 
cal and genetic information possible 
to potential parents can w e  actually 
save the babies who might have been 
aborted because of unfounded fears 
of defects6 Information can save a s  
well as destroy. Abortions are  cur- 
rently legal and are, therefore, part of 
a woman's reproductive choices, no  
matter how undesirable we may indi- 
vidually find such a state of affairs. 
The tort system should not immunize 
a whole category of medical practi- 
tioners-and their negligence-in or- 
der to take a stand against abortion. 

The couple in Case 2 cannot seek 

Parents need accurate information on  
potential genetic defects; abortions 
and other procedures should be safely 
performed. Physicians must, in fair- 
ness, be iudged against rhe standards 
of their specialities. rather than ex- 
empted in this narrow category of 
cases. 
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Caselaw on Fetal Monitoring 

Dear Editors: 
The recent article by BarF  Schifrin, 

Henry Weissman, and Jerry Wiley- 
"Electronic Fetal Monitoring and Ob- 
stetrical Malpractice," in the June 
1985 issue-may give readers the 
impression. since no cases are cited 
on the points that they make, that 
none exist. 

Williams u. Lallie Krnip Hospital, 
428 S.2d 1000 (La. App. 1983), cert. 
&it. i3 - i  S.2d 1093. in fact, holds pre- 

In Williams it was held that 
proof of failure to comply 
with ACOG standards would 
be sufficient, as a matter of 
law, to permit a finding of 
negligence. 

cisely against the major point the au- 
thors argue. I n  that case it was held 
that proof of failure to comply with 
ACOG standards would b e  sufficient. 
as a matter of law. to permit a finding 
of negligence. There is a clear infer- 
ence in the opinion that compliance 
would, equally, b e  sufficient to pre- 
clude it.  Other directly relevant fetal 
monitoring case> are: ( 1 J Walker I ?  

Utzited States, 600 F. Supp. 195 (D.C. 
DC 1985): (2)  Haugbt 1'. ~ ~ ~ f l c r h ~ c l ~ .  
681 F.2d 291 (CCA 5, 1982); (3) First 
National Bairk of Chicago 1'. Porkr ,  
i48 N.E.Ld 256 (111. App. 1983); and 
(4) Jams 1'. Karraker, ii0 N.E.2d -120 
(111. App. 1982). 

Relevant material is also discussed 
in the supplement to i0 ALH 3d 1222, 
"Liability for prenatal injuries," Sec. 
tion 9. 

Feinberg, Peters. Willson, and Kroll 
also discuss this issue in their Obstet- 
rics, Gynecology and the Law, at 
pages 374-78. 
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