
News and Notes

Activities

Colin Campbell, S.J., associate professor, York
University in Toronto, has received a Faculty of
Arts Fellowship for 1980-81, which gives him
two-thirds release time for completing a book
based on his four-nation study of central
agencies with George Szablowski of York.
Campbell recently became President of the
Canadian Study of Parliament Group and Aca-
demic Director of the Ontario Legislative Intern
Program.

Patricia S. Florestano, Director, Maryland Tech-
nical Advisory Service, University of Maryland,
College Park, has been elected Chairman of the
Governing Board of the Council of University
Institutes of Urban Affairs. The Council is
composed of teaching, research and service
units in institutions of higher education which
are focused on urban affairs. Florestano is a
member of the APSA National Council and
co-chairperson designate of the Program Plan-
ning Committee.

Donald L. Horowitz of the Research Institute
of Immigration and Ethnic Studies, Smithsoni-
an Institution, delivered the McDonald-Currie
Lectures at McGill University in Montreal,
Canada, from February 18-22. His topic was
"Ethnic Conflict and Accommodation in Com-
parative Perspective."

Gary McDowell, assistant professor of political
science at Dickinson College, has been awarded
a Fellowship Research Grant from the Earhart
Foundation for 1980-81 to complete his study,
Chains of Gold: Richard Henry Lee and the
American Constitution.

Sheldon Simon of Arizona State University
traveled in the summer of 1979 under the
auspices of the U.S. International Communica-
tion Agency and the Earhart Foundation
throughout East Asia, giving symposia at uni-
versities and government assemblies on ASEAN
and the future of Asian security. He also
conducted interviews with government officials
and academic specialists on the same topic.
During the 1979-80 academic year, while a
visiting professor at the University of British
Columbia, Professor Simon has delivered a
paper on Soviet policy toward Southeast Asia
to the Council on Foreign Relations and lec-
tured on Asian security matters to Lester
Pearson College in Victoria, B.C., the Canadian
Armed Forces western region base in Chilawak,
B.C., and the Air War College in Montgomery,
Alabama. In May 1980, Simon delivered a
paper at the University of Illinois Institute of
Policy Studies conference on the Security Poli-
cies of Emerging States. His paper dealt with
Vietnam.

Philippa Strum, professor of political science,
Brooklyn College, CUNY, has been named a
Fellow of the American Council of Learned
Societies, and has received a fellowship grant to
aid in completion of her political biography of
Justice Louis Dembitz Brandeis.

New Appointments

Mark S. Frankel, Project Director, Center for
the Study of Ethics in the Professions, Illinois
Institute of Technology; formerly assistant pro-
fessor of political science at Wayne State
University.

Douglas J. Griffith, instructor, Inver Hills Com-
munity College.
Jeffrey Hart, associate professor, Indiana Uni-
versity
R. Lawson Veasey, assistant professor and
Director of Public Administration, University
of Central Arkansas.
Douglas Rivers, assistant professor, Harvard
University.

Visiting and Temporary Appointments

Henry W. Ehrmann has been a visiting professor
at the University of California, San Diego,
during the Winter term 1980. During the Spring
semester he will be a visiting professor at the
University of Mannheim, Germany.

Jean Elshtain, visiting associate professor, Yale
University.

Robert C. Gray, assistant professor of govern-
ment at Franklin and Marshall College, is a
Council on Foreign Relations International
Affairs Fellow for 1979-80. He is spending the
year as a policy analyst in the Office of the
Secretary of Defense.
Roy E. Green, University of Alabama, will be
on a mobility assignment with the Office of
Evaluation, Office of Community Planning and
Development, Department of Housing and Ur-
ban Development during the year beginning
May 1980.

Jeffrey Hart, professional staff member, Presi-
dent's Commission for a National Agenda for
the Eighties, through December, 1980.

Manus I. Midlarsky, visiting professor at the
University of Michigan, will be directing a
summer seminar sponsored by the National
Endowment for the Humanities, entitled " In-
equality and Contemporary Revolutions." The
seminar will be held at the University of
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Michigan in Ann Arbor from June 16 until
August 8, 1980.
Arthur Miller, University of Michigan, will
spend May and June, 1980 at the University of
Gothenberg, Political Studies Institute, where
he will collaborate with Soren Holmberg and
Kent Asp on a comparative study of the mass
media in Sweden and the United States. The
visit is supported by a grant from the Swedish
Bicentennial Fund.

Glenn R. Parker, Florida State University, is a
guest scholar at The Brookings Institution in
Washington, D.C. during the 1979-80 academic
year. He is the recipient of a National Science
Foundation grant to study committee decision
making in the U.S. House of Representatives;
the grant is for $97,878 for a two-year period
beginning September 1979.

Donald M. Snow, University of Alabama, is on
assignment to the Air Force Staff and Com-
mand College in Montgomery. The one-year
assignment began January 1980.
Tracy Strong, visiting lecturer, Yale University.

Robert P. Wolff, visiting professor, Yale Univer-
sity.

Steven J. Rosenstone, assistant professor, Yale
University.

Retirements

Cecil V. Crabb, Jr. has retired as chairman of
the Department of Political Science to become
full-time professor of political science, Louisi-
ana State University.

Corrections

PS wishes to note the following corrections:
Hugh Perry, Texas A&M University, was omit-
ted as a member of the Committee on the
Status of Blacks in the Professor on the list of
APSA Committee members in the Winter PS.
PS regrets the error.

Thomas Remington's dissertation completed
listing in the Fall PS, p. 570, "Democracy and
Development in Bolshevik Socialism, 1917-
1921," Yale University, was incorrectly listed
under Thomas Tamington. PS regrets the error.

Administrative Appointments

Harlan Cleveland, Director, Hubert Humphrey
Institute of Public Affairs at the University of
Minnesota.
Lela Garner Noble, associate dean for academic
affairs, San Jose State University.
Fauneil J. Rinn; associate dean, undergraduate
studies, San Jose State University.
Ellis Sandoz, chairman, Department of Political
Science, Louisiana State University, Baton
Rouge, Louisiana.

Howard J. Wiarda, University of Massachusetts,
Amherst, and Visiting Scholar at the Center for
International Affairs, Harvard University, has
been named Editor of Polity, beginning Sep-
tember 1, 1980.

Promotions

Frank T. Colon, Department of Government,
Lehigh University, was promoted to full profes-
sor, January 1980.
Lubomir Gleiman, formerly chairman of the
Political Science Department at Newton College
and Senior Newton Fellow in Political Philoso-
phy at Boston College, is now professor of
philosophy and chairman of the Department of
Philosophy and Religious Studies at The New-
port College-Salve Regina, Newport, Rhode
Island.

Eleanor V. Laudicina, associate professor, Kean
College.
Man Peleg, chairman, international affairs pro-
gram and a member of the department of
government and law, Lafayette College.

In Memoriam

Arthur Whittier Macmahon

Arthur Whittier Macmahon, a teacher at Colum-
bia University for 45 years prior to his retire-
ment in 1958, died February 4, 1980 in the
Crosslands skilled nursing facility at Kennett
Square, Pennsylvania. A sudden massive stroke
put a merciful end to an incapacitating illness.

He was born in Brooklyn, New York, on May
29, 1890 and graduated from Columbia College
in 1912. He became a legendary teacher of
generations of Columbia students, beginning as
an instructor in 1913.

He served an early apprenticeship as assistant to
another legendary Columbia teacher, the his-
torian and political scientist Charles A. Beard;
but many years later broke with Beard over the
issue of aid to Britain in 1941, which Beard
opposed and Macmahon ardently favored.

Meanwhile he completed his Ph.D. at Columbia
in 1923 and presently became a moving force in
the developing field of public administration as
a profession and an academic discipline.
Thoroughly grounded in public law, as was the
mode of the times for students of American
government (historians largely occupied the
parties field), he turned rather to perceptive
observation of government institutions and
agencies in action, and to the dynamics of
political conflict and consensus. He took no
parochial view of his subject, which embraced
the formation and administration of public
policy, particularly the politics of public enter-
prise and economic policy and the complicated
workings of federal regimes, both in the United
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