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example in the Arctic Ocean, the Labrador Sea or the North Atlantic. The book concludes with three
chapters one of which discusses the economic geology of the region, while the other two summarize the
cases for and against a major displacement along the 'Wegener Fault' along the Nares Strait.

As with any volume of this kind containing papers by a variety of authors, some are better than
others. The editors have, however, done an admirable job and in this volume I would rate the average
quality to be very high. There are numerous maps and diagrams and halftone photographs which are
well reproduced.

As a scientific enterprise I judge this to have been well conceived and well executed. It is a fascinating
volume that should hold much interest both for Arctic specialists and those with wider interests in
regional geology or even in scientific controversy.

ANTARCTICA A WORLD PARK?

[Review by Bernard Stonehouse* of James N. Barnes's Lei's save Antarctica!, Victoria, Australia,
Richmond Publications, 1982,96 p, illus. Soft cover $7.95.]

James N. Barnes, a lawyer who specializes in international and environmental law at the Center for
Law and Social Policy in Washington, DC, is a member of the US State Department's Advisory
Committee on Antarctica. As a co-founder of the Antarctic and Southern Ocean Coalition (ASOC), he
is one of a group strongly in favour of protecting Antarctica from, mineral and oil exploration and
exploitation, and urging governments to implement the Convention on the Conservation of Antarctic
Marine Living Resources; he and ASOC want to see Antarctica designated a World Park. This brief,
well-illustrated book (with a foreword by Sir Peter Scott) he describes as 'a handbook to help concerned
people save Antarctica'. Its aims in his own words are to present facts and environmental issues, to give
practical information about the present political situation, treaty status and countries involved in
Antarctica, to educate and inform the general public and decision makers, to alert people to the
consequences of environmental devastation of Antarctica, and to enable people everywhere to help
protect this unique, rich region from such devastation.

Layout is businesslike and to the point. A short introduction tackles the questions of why Antarctica
is under threat, why it should be protected, what conservationists and environmentalists who take the
ASOC viewpoint are trying to accomplish, and how the reader can help—ending with a brief statement
on the Antarctic Treaty and some of its strengths and limitations as political background information.
Four longer sections deal with these points in more detail, under the headings 'Why do we care about
Antarctica?', 'Who controls Antarctica?', 'What is going on in Antarctica?' and 'What can you do to
save Antarctica?' There is a single page of conclusions, followed by 20 appendices which together
occupy over half the book. These include the texts of the Antarctic Treaty, the Agreed Measures for the
Conservation of Antarctic Flora and Fauna, the Convention for the Conservation of Antarctic Seals and
the Convention on the Conservation of Antarctic Marine Living Resources, and comments on other
legislation and decisions of conservation bodies that in one way or another affect the Antarctic and
Southern Ocean regions. There are also lists of acronyms and of organizations interested in Antarctica,
statements of ASOC policy in letters to the US president and other heads of state, a bibliography
and—for the convinced reader—forms for subscribing to ASOC, joining the Antarctic Project, and
petitioning the Antarctic. Treaty powers and the UN General Assembly to take immediate steps to
declare Antarctica a World Park.

Altogether this is an attractive book, refreshingly free from waffle and down-to-earth in its approach.
Though frankly polemical, it is better informed and more informative than the average run of books
that aim to present conservation issues to the public. Specialist scientists may be able to fault it in detail
(my copy from the author contains several hand-written corrections which one hopes will be put right
when the book—deservedly—is reprinted). It remains, however, a useful handbook on some issues of
Antarctic conservation. It voices misgiving that, clearly, many both outside and inside the 'club' of
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Treaty nations feel about the future of Antarctica and the Southern Oceans—the seeming inevitability
of exploitation and the spread of pollution, the secrecy of Treaty meetings and the blandness of
statements coming from them, the assumption that only the Treaty powers have rights there, and the
doubts (serious doubts indeed) as to whether the Treaty will be able to cope with the politics of
ownership once economic exploitation begins. Like many others I share the author's concern, though I
am far from convinced that the World Park remedy, first put forward in the US in 1972, is the right
one. It might satisfy Third World nations and others outside the charmed circle of Treaty powers, but
what evidence have we that the United Nations would run Antarctica more fittinelv? lames Barnes
misses a point by not telling us more of the practicalities—who would organize it and how—a
surprising omission in an otherwise practical book. Nevertheless I shall recommend Let's save
Antarctica to all my students, both undergraduate and postgraduate, and expect to get a few good
arguments going from it. I recommend it too for every university, college and school library that caters
for polar, environmental, geographical, political and sociological teaching, and to every reader who
cares for the future of Antarctica and needs a briefing—a cheerfully biased one—on what is happening
there. Published in Australia, the book is currently hard to find in Britain; I hope it may soon become
more readily available.

PORTRAIT OF ANTARCTICA

[Review by H. G. R. King* of Kevin Walton's Portrait of Antarctica. London, George Philip, 1983,168p,
illus. Hard cover £9.95.]

Portrait of Antarctica is a slightly misleading title as this book is largely to do with the Antarctic
Peninsula, in particular the region between Adelaide Island and Alexander Island. This is the territory
closely associated with the surveys carried out by John Rymill's British Graham Land Expedition
(BGLE) of 1934-37, the post-war establishment of permanent stations by the Falkland Islands
Dependencies Survey (FIDS) and the subsequent detailed scientific work pursued by the British
Antarctic Survey (BAS). The underlying idea of this book is to illustrate in words and pictures
changing methods of field exploration over the past 50 years. It starts when huskies were still the
mainstay of land transport and wireless communication was in its infancy, and ends with dogs evolved
into skidoos, regular radio communication between field parties taken for granted, and powerful
icebreakers and turbo-prop aircraft ensuring the regular supply and relief of bases.

The photography is the work of five men whose experience in the field covers the half century.
Launcelot Fleming (subsequently Bishop of Norwich and Dean of Windsor) was geologist and
chaplain on the BGLE. Kevin Walton, a civil engineer, was with FIDS between 1945-48 and is author
of the classic Twoyears in the Antarctic. Jonathan Walton, Kevin's son, served with BAS in 1973-76 and
again in 1978; his brother-in-law Jim Bishop, tragically killed in the Karakoram in 1980, also served
with BAS in 1972-75. Paul Goodall-Copestake, who contributes a final chapter on wildlife, is Kevin
Walton's nephew, currently working with BAS on Bird Island, South Georgia. Such expertise ensures
that what might have turned out to be merely another glossy coffee table book is in fact rather more.
The magnificent photographs have been carefully selected to illustrate contrasts in land, sea and air
travel over the years. But readers who can avert their eyes from them will discover that the chapter
summaries and picture captions contain a mine of detailed information on aspects of living and
travelling in this difficult and daunting terrain.

Two aspects of the book (which is to be published on 27 October) slightly bother this reviewer. The
first is an assumption, probably unconscious, that the reader is already acquainted with the history of
the region; some readers may well be puzzled by occasional references to past events outside their ken,
as well as by the constant to-ing and fro-ing in time demanded by the book's structure. The second
relates to the final chapter Wildlife, which seems like an afterthought and does not fit happily into the
general scheme of things. It could perhaps have been omitted and the space devoted to some
conclusions and perhaps a look into the future.
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